



**BID TABULATION – NOTICE OF AWARD
CORRUGATED STEEL PIPE ARCHES
AND ALUMINIZED STEEL PIPE ARCHES
BID OPENING – 1/19/2023**

Proposer: Chemung Supply
Price/L.F. Price/Ea. Price/L.F. Price/Ea.

Corrugations: 2-2/3" x 1/2"

Span

	GALVANIZED		ALUMINIZED	
	<u>Price/L.F.</u>	<u>Price/Ea.</u>	<u>Price/L.F.</u>	<u>Price/Ea.</u>
42"	\$96.06	\$202.22	\$100.06	\$202.22
49"	\$115.07	\$244.36	\$119.74	\$244.36
57"	\$164.91	\$320.19	\$172.13	\$320.19
64"	\$194.28	\$485.69	\$202.39	\$485.69
71"	\$259.28	\$529.03	\$270.72	\$529.03
77"	\$317.06	\$665.82	\$329.61	\$665.82
83"	\$422.50	\$870.35	\$440.49	\$870.35

Proposer: Bradco Supply
Price/L.F. Price/Ea. Price/L.F. Price/Ea.

	GALVANIZED		ALUMINIZED	
	<u>Price/L.F.</u>	<u>Price/Ea.</u>	<u>Price/L.F.</u>	<u>Price/Ea.</u>
	\$94.44	\$198.83	\$98.87	\$198.83
	\$113.13	\$240.25	\$117.73	\$240.25
	\$162.13	\$314.82	\$169.24	\$314.82
	\$191.02	\$477.54	\$198.99	\$477.54
	\$254.93	\$520.16	\$266.19	\$520.16
	\$311.74	\$645.31	\$324.09	\$645.31
	\$333.05	\$912.15	\$346.48	\$912.15

Corrugations: 5" x 1"

Span

	GALVANIZED		ALUMINIZED	
	<u>Price/L.F.</u>	<u>Price/Ea.</u>	<u>Price/L.F.</u>	<u>Price/Ea.</u>
87"	\$401.56	\$1,155.19	\$418.44	\$1,155.19
95"	\$427.56	\$1,223.44	\$445.78	\$1,223.44
103"	\$451.39	\$1,291.69	\$470.83	\$1,291.69
112"	\$479.56	\$1,367.53	\$500.44	\$1,367.53
117"	\$501.22	\$1,428.19	\$523.22	\$1,428.19
128"	\$529.39	\$1,504.03	\$552.83	\$1,504.03
137"	\$553.22	\$1,572.28	\$577.89	\$1,572.28
142"	\$579.22	\$1,640.53	\$605.22	\$1,640.53

Corrugations: 3" x 1"

	GALVANIZED		ALUMINIZED	
	<u>Price/L.F.</u>	<u>Price/Ea.</u>	<u>Price/L.F.</u>	<u>Price/Ea.</u>
	\$394.82	\$1,135.84	\$411.43	\$1,135.84
	\$420.39	\$1,202.95	\$438.31	\$1,202.95
	\$443.83	\$1,270.04	\$462.94	\$1,270.04
	\$471.52	\$1,346.62	\$492.06	\$1,346.62
	\$492.83	\$1,404.26	\$514.46	\$1,404.26
	\$520.52	\$1,478.84	\$543.57	\$1,478.84
	\$543.96	\$1,545.94	\$568.21	\$1,545.94
	\$569.52	\$1,613.05	\$595.09	\$1,613.05

Department of Public Works

477 State Route 96 Owego, NY 13827



☎ 607 687 0302 📠 607 687 4453 🌐 www.TiogaCountyNY.com

Gary Hammond, P.E. Commissioner Rich Perkins, P.E. Deputy Commissioner

GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED
Proposer: Crossroads Highway Supply
Price/L.F. Price/Ea. Price/L.F. Price/Ea.

Corrugations: 2-2/3" x 1/2"

Span

42"	\$86.45	\$182.00	\$90.50	\$182.00
49"	\$103.55	\$219.91	\$107.76	\$219.91
57"	\$148.41	\$288.16	\$154.91	\$288.16
64"	\$174.85	\$437.11	\$182.14	\$437.11
71"	\$233.34	\$476.12	\$243.65	\$476.12
77"	\$285.34	\$590.67	\$296.65	\$590.67
83"	\$304.85	\$834.91	\$317.14	\$834.91

GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED
Proposer: Lane Enterprises
Price/L.F. Price/Ea. Price/L.F. Price/Ea.

	\$70.42	\$105.63	\$73.26	\$109.89
	\$81.54	\$122.31	\$84.85	\$127.28
	\$128.60	\$192.90	\$133.87	\$200.81
	\$143.90	\$215.85	\$149.82	\$224.73
	\$197.91	\$296.87	\$211.59	\$317.39
	\$266.18	\$399.27	No Bid	No Bid
	\$289.55	\$579.10	No Bid	No Bid

Corrugations: 3" x 1"

Span

87"	\$361.40	\$1,039.67	\$376.60	\$1,039.67
95"	\$384.80	\$1,101.10	\$401.20	\$1,101.10
103"	\$406.25	\$1,162.51	\$423.74	\$1,162.51
112"	\$431.60	\$1,230.77	\$450.40	\$1,230.77
117"	\$451.10	\$1,285.36	\$470.90	\$1,285.36
128"	\$476.45	\$1,353.63	\$497.54	\$1,353.63
137"	\$497.90	\$1,415.05	\$520.10	\$1,415.05
142"	\$521.30	\$1,476.48	\$544.70	\$1,476.48

Corrugations: 3" x 1"

	\$312.25	\$624.50	\$334.43	\$668.68
	\$334.92	\$669.84	\$358.78	\$717.56
	\$357.67	\$715.34	\$383.21	\$766.42
	\$380.37	\$760.74	\$407.59	\$815.18
	\$403.15	\$806.30	\$432.05	\$864.10
	\$429.20	\$858.40	\$459.78	\$919.56
	\$451.98	\$903.96	\$484.25	\$968.50
	\$474.86	\$949.72	\$508.81	\$1,017.62

Commodity awarded based on lowest price per linear foot.

It is understood that the Towns and Villages of Tioga County may also participate in the awarded bid prices by dealing directly with the proposer.

*** CONTRACT AWARD**

Lane Enterprises, LLC
 16 May Street
 Bath, NY 14810
 (607) 776-3366

Crossroads Highway Supply
 103 Mary Lane
 Nedrow, NY 13120
 (315) 478-1824

Richard Perkins, P.E.
 Deputy Commissioner
 Tioga County Public Works