TIOGA COUNTY, NEW YORK

Department of Public Works

477 State Route 96 Oweqgo, NY 13827

. 607 687 0302 & 607 687 4453 Q@ www TicgaCountyNY.com
Gary Hammond, P.E. Commissioner  Rich Perkins, P.E Deputy Commissioner

BID TABULATION - NOTICE OF AWARD
SMOOTH INTERIOR CORRUGATED POLYETHYLENE CULVERT PIPE
BID OPENING 1/22/2021

PROPOSER:; Advanced Drainage Systems”
Bands
DIAMETER $/LF. $/Bach $/End Sect

12" Pipe 5.00 7.76 154.00
Band

15" Pipe 6.53 10.71 154.00
Band

18" Pipe 9.70 17.16 207.00
Band

24" Pipe 15.27 24.31 266.00
Band

30" Pipe 23.55 57.46 647.00
Band

36" Pipe 30.26 79.34 685.00
Band

48" Pipe 51.90 132.83 No Bid
Band

60" Pipe 97.33  220.97 No Bid
Band

PROPOSER: Chemung Supply*
Bands
DIAMETER $/LF. $/Each $/End Sect

12" Pipe 5.00 7.76 154.00
Band

15" Pipe 6.53 10.71 154.00
Band

18" Pipe 9.70 17.16 207.00
Band

24" Pipe 15.27 24.31 266.00
Band

30" Pipe 23.55 57.46 647.00
Band

36" Pipe 30.26 79.34 685.00
Band

48" Pipe 51.90 132.83 No Bid
Band

60" Pipe 97.33 22097 No Bid

Band



TIOGA COUNTY, NEW YORK

Department of Public Works

477 State Route 96 Owego, NY 13827

. 607 687 0302 & 607 687 4452 @ www.TiogaCountyNY.com
Gary Hammond, P.E. Commuzsioner  Rich Perkins, P.E Deputy Commissicaer

It is understood that all Towns and Villages in Tioga County, N.Y. may participate in the awarded bid by
dealing directly with the dealer.

* . Contract Award

Advanced Drainage Systems, Inc. Chemung Supply
4640 Trueman Blvd. PO BOX 527
Hilliard, Ohio 43026 Elmira, NY 14902
{614) 658-0050 (607) 733-5506
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Richard Perkins, P.E.
Deputy Commissioner
Tioga County Public Works



