Tioga County Department of Public Works
477 Route 96

Gary Hammond, P.E. Owego, NY 13827 Richard Perkins, P.E.
Commissioner of Public Works 607-687-0302 Deputy Commissioner of Public Works
607-687-4453 Fax

BID TABULATION - NOTICE OF AWARD
AGGREGATE PROCESSING
BID OPENING - 4/2/21

UNIT BID PRICES PER TON

BIDDER: Daggett BIDDER: F.S. Lopke

Bank Run  Cobbles Bank Run Cobbles
Crusher wf Operator|  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |/C.Y.
$3.00 $3.35 $3.75 $4.25 |Mon
Optional Loader wf Operator| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |/C.Y.
$3.20 $3.40 $3.90 $4.45 |Ton
Optional Dozer w/ Operator| N Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [/C.Y.
$4.75 $4.95 $4.10 $4.60 |[/Ton
Optional Dozer & Loader w/| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |/C.Y.
Operator $5.30 $5.60 $5.20 $5.60 (/Ton

BIDDER: RMS BIDDER: Viltager

Bank Run Cobbles Bank Run  Cobbles
Crusher w/ Operator] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [/C.Y.
$3.44 $3.74 $2.95 $3.25 |Ton
Optional Loader w/ Operator| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [/C.Y.
$3.74 $3.99 $1.50 $1.65 |Ton
Optional Dozer wf Operator| No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid [/C.Y.
$5.14 $5.44 $1.50 $1.65 |/Ton
Optional Dozer & Loader w/| No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid [|/C.Y.
Operator No Bid No Bid $2.85 $3.15 |/Ton

Itis understood that the Towns and Villages of Ticga County may also participate in the awarded bid prices by dealing directly
with the proposer.

Each municipality will determine its own best price. Municipalities should not use the County bid for any items involving labor.

Bid Award:

F.S. Lopke Contracting inc. RMS Gravel, Inc. Villager Construction, Inc.
3430 State Route 434 PO Box 455 425 Old Macedon Center Road
Apalachin, New York 13732 Dryden, New York 13053 Fairport, New York 14450
{607) 687-1114 {607) 844-8196 (585) 223-7697

Daggett Sand and Gravel, Inc.

4716 Route 328

Millerton PA 169386

{570) 537-2347 * .

« (___

Richard Perkins, P.E.
Deputy Commissioner
Tioga County Public Works




