
Size Ply Type

Tubeless, Steel Belted

1. All Weather GY Assurance A/S $57.64 GY Assurance A/S $57.64

2. Snow GY Winter Command $64.74 GY Winter Command $64.74

1. All Weather GY Assurance A/S $62.53 GY Assurance A/S $62.53

2. Snow GY Winter Command $67.47 GY Winter Command $67.47

1. All Weather GY Assurance A/S $62.92 GY Assurance A/S $62.92

2. Snow GY Winter Command $68.64 GY Winter Command $68.64

1. All Weather GY Assurance A/S $72.85 GY Assurance A/S $62.92

2. Snow GY Winter Command $77.55 GY Winter Command $68.64

1. All Weather No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2. Snow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1. All Weather GY Assurance A/S $72.20 GY Assurance A/S $72.20

2. Snow GY Winter Command $81.64 GY Winter Command $81.64

1. All Weather GY Assurance A/S $78.52 GY Assurance A/S $78.52

2. Snow GY Winter Command $91.81 GY Winter Command $91.81

1. All Weather GY Assurance A/S $74.23 GY Assurance A/S $74.23

2. Snow GY Winter Command $81.61 GY Winter Command $81.11

1. All Weather GY Assurance A/S $71.53 GY Assurance A/S $71.53

2. Snow GY Winter Command $86.26 GY Winter Command $86.26

P225/65/17 4 1. All Weather GY Assurance A/S $87.20 GY Assurance A/S $87.20

1. All Weather GY Fortitude H/T $122.00 GY TrailRunner A/T $96.87

2. Snow GY Winter Command $97.57 GY Winter Command $97.67

1. All Weather GY Assurance A/S $91.57 GY Eagle LS2 $75.17

2. Snow GY Winter Command $99.45 GY Winter Command $99.45

1. All Weather GY Wrangler SRA $103.40 GY SRA $103.40

2. Snow GY Trailrunner A/T $83.10 GY TrailRunner A/T $83.10

1. All Weather GY Wrangler Fortitude H/T $110.29 GY Wrangler ST $75.97

P225/65/16 4

P195/65R-15

P205/65/16

P215/60R-16 4

P215/65/17 4

P225/60/16 4

P225/75/15 4

P225/75/16 4
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A. AUTOMOBILE TIRES
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P225/55/17

P255/70/17



2. Snow GY Trailrunner A/T $93.18 GY TrailRunner A/T $93.18

1. All Weather GY Assurance A/S $88.95 GY Assurance A/S $88.95

2. Snow GY Winter Command $102.25 GY Winter Command $102.25

1. All Weather GY Assurance A/S $111.83 GY Assurance A/S $111.83

2. Snow GY Winter Command $131.01 GY Winter Command $131.01

1. All Weather GY Wrangler SRA $106.73 GY Fortitude H/T $112.89

2. Snow GY Winter Command $131.17 GY Winter Command $131.17

P225/75/16 4

4P235/55/17

P265/60/18 4

P245/60/18 4



Size Ply Type

Tubeless, Steel Belted

1. Summer GY Eagle RSA $91.00 GY Eagle RSA $91.00

2. Snow GY Ultra Grip GW2 $93.00 GY Eagle Ultra Grip $93.00

235/55R 17 4 1. All Weather GY Eagle RSA $105.00 GY Eagle RSA $105.00

235/55R 17 4 1. Snow GY Ultra Grip GW3 $110.00 GY Eagle Ultra Grip $110.00

245/55R 18 4 1. All Weather GY Eagle RSA $122.00 GY Eagle RSA $122.00

245/55R 18 4 1. Snow GY Eagle Winter Enforcer $136.00 GY Eagle Winter Enforcer $136.00

1. All Weather GY Assurance Maxlife $126.46 GY Wrangler SRA $106.73

2. Snow GY Assurance Weather Ready $159.85 GY Winter Command $131.17

Size Ply Type Description $/Tire Description $/Tire Description $/Tire

Tubeless, Steel Belted

225/60R-18 4 1. All Weather GY Eagle RSA $111.00 GY Eagle RSA $111.00

225/60R-18 4 1. Snow GY Eagle Winter Enforcer $125.00 GY Eagle Winter Enforcer $125.00

Description $/TireDescription $/Tire

H RATED HIGH SPEED TIRES

225/60R 16 4

V RATED HIGH SPEED TIRES

Description $/Tire

265/60R 18 4



Size Ply Type

LT215/85/16 10 Traction- Mud/Snow GY Wrangler Trailrunner A/T $114.00 GY TrailRunner A/T $114.00

LT/225/70R-16 10 Traction- Mud/Snow GY Ultra Grip Ice WRT $106.24 GY TrailRunner A/T $105.00

LT225/70R-19.5 10 Traction- Mud/Snow GY G622 RSD $236.25 GY G622 RSD $236.25

LT/225/75R-16 10 Tubeless, Steel Belted 

Mud/Snow

GY Wrangler Trailrunner A/T $105.00 GY TrailRunner A/T $105.00

LT235/65/17 10 Tubeless, Steel Belted 

Mud/Snow

No Bid No Bid GY TrailRunner A/T $97.50

LT235/75R-16 8 Tubeless, Steel Belted 

Mud/Snow

GY Fortitude HT XL $121.42 GY Fortitude H/T $121.42

LT 235/75/15 8 Tubeless, Steel Belted 

Mud/Snow

No Bid No Bid GY TrailRunner A/T $63.65

LT235/85R-16 10 Tubeless, Steel Belted 

Mud/Snow

GY Wrangler Trailrunner A/T $108.00 GY TrailRunner A/T $108.00

LT245/70R-17 Tubeless - Mud/Snow GY Wrangler Trailrunner A/T $125.00 GY TrailRunner A/T $125.00

LT245/70R-19.5 Tubeless - Rib GY G647 RSS $246.75 GY G647 RSS $246.00

LT245/70R-19.5 Tubeless - Mud/Snow GY G622 RSD $246.75 GY G622 RSD $246.00

LT245/75/16 10 Tubeless, Steel Belted 

Mud/Snow

GY Wrangler Trailrunner A/T $111.00 GY TrailRunner A/T $111.00

LT255/70/16 10 Tubeless, Steel Belted 

Mud/Snow

GY Wrangler Trailrunner A/T $106.86 GY TrailRunner A/T $99.24

LT255/75/16 8 / 10 Tubeless, Steel Belted 

Mud/Snow

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

LT265/70R-17 10 Tubeless, Steel Belted 

Mud/Snow

GY Wrangler Trailrunner A/T $134.00 GY TrailRunner A/T $134.00

LT265/70/18 10 Tubeless, Steel Belted 

Mud/Snow

GY Wrangler Trailrunner A/T $132.00 GY TrailRunner A/T $132.00

LT245/75R-17 10 Tubeless, Steel Belted 

Mud/Snow

GY Wrangler Trailrunner A/T $125.00 GY TrailRunner A/T $125.00

LT275/55R-20 10 Tubeless, Steel Belted 

Mud/Snow

GY Wrangler Trailrunner A/T $137.23 GY TrailRunner A/T $137.23

LT275/75R-18 10 Tubeless, Steel Belted 

Mud/Snow

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$/TireDescription$/TireDescription$/TireDescription

GY Wrangler Trailrunner A/T $130.00

B. Truck Tires

Tubeless, Steel Belted 

Mud/Snow

GY TrailRunner A/T $130.00LT235/80R-17 10



Size Ply Type
Description $/Tire Description $/Tire Description $/Tire

8.25XR20** 12 Tube - Traction Loadmaxx Trac Set $179.00 Import Bias Drive $350.00

9.00X22.5R 12 Tubeless - Rib GY G661 HSA $265.00 G4 G661 $265.00

9.00X22.5R 12 Tubeless - Traction No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10.00 R20** 12 Tube - Rib Loadmaxx Highway Set $218.00 Import Bias Rib $285.00

10.00 R20** 12 Tube - Traction Loadmaxx Trac Set $232.00 Import Bias Drive $290.00

11.00 R22.5 14 Tube - Rib GY Marathon RSS $273.00 GY Marathon RSS $273.00

11.00 R22.5 14 Tube - Traction GY Marathon RTD $309.75 GY Marathon PTD $309.00

11.00 R24.5 12 Tubeless - Rib GY Marathon RSS $294.00 GY Marathon RSS $294.00

11.00 R24.5 16 Tubeless - Traction Galaxy DR 271-G $336.00 GY G622 $362.25

255/70-R22.5 18 Tubeless - Rib Galaxy AR211-G 16ply $216.00 General H/T $313.00

295/75-R22.5 18 Regional A/P GY Marathon RSS $273.00 GY Marathon RSS $273.00

315/80 R22.5 18 Tubeless - Rib Goodride CR926B $387.00 Import Rib $475.00

315/80 R22.5 18 Tubeless - Traction Sumitomo ST908 $556.00 General W/T $510.00

385/65 R22.5** 18 Tubeless - Rib Arisun AT557 20 ply $455.00 Dunlop SP231 $477.75

425/65 R22.5 18 Tubeless - Rib Arisun AT557 20 ply $546.00 Dunlop SP231 $550.00

** STEEL BELTED



Size Ply Type
Description $/Tire Description $/Tire Description $/Tire

9R 22.5 Regional A/P GY G661 HSA $265.00 GY G661 $265.00

10.00 X 16.5 8 Tubeless - Traction Loadmaxx SKS 10 ply $94.00 R-4 Import $115.00

11L-15 SL Farm Rib Alliance 546 12 ply $87.00 F-3 Camso $148.00

12.5/80-18 A6 Loadmaxx R4 12 ply $189.00 R-4 Import $235.00

14.00-24TG Camso TLH 532 12 ply $423.00 Galaxy L-2/G-2 $425.00

14.5 LT Traction No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

14.9-28 Bar Cropmaxx R1 8 ply $349.00 Crop Max $368.00

16.9-24 10 Tube-Lug Deestone D314 R4 12 ply $430.00 EZ Rider Galaxy $458.00

17.5R25 12 Tubeless-Lug Galaxy MGSR 200 GZ $735.00 Galaxy MGSR 200 $720.00

18.4-38 Bar Cropmaxx R1 10 ply $635.00 R-1 Galaxy $647.00

19.5L-24 12 Galaxy EZ Rider R4 $415.00 R-4 Galaxy EZ Rider $440.00

385/65R 22.5 Pneumatic tire Arisun AT557 20 ply $455.00 General Grabber OA $564.00

225/75R 15 D-Rated Trailer Castlerock ST226 10 ply $55.00 Gladiator Rib ST $85.00

225/75R 16 D-Rated Trailer Americus CLT 10 ply $108.00 Milemark ST Trailer $103.00

$1,586.00Tubeless-Lug $1,894.00Galaxy LDSR 300

Galaxy LDSR 300 $1,358.00Tubeless-Lug

23.5R25

20.5R25 A

16

C. HEAVY EQUIPMENT TIRES

Galaxy MGSR 200 G2 $1,264.00

Triangle TB516 2* E3/L3




